
From:  British North America Legislative Database; University of New Brunswick 
bnald.lib.unb.ca 
 

12 Victoria – Chapter 132  1 

Laws of Her Majesty's Province of Upper Canada, passed in the year 1849. Montreal: Stewart 
Derbishire & George Desbarats, 1849. 

 
12 Victoria – Chapter 132 
 
An Act to annex a certain part of the Township of Upton to the County of St. Hyacinth, for 
Judicial and Municipal purposes. 30th May, 1849. 
 
Whereas from the great distance at which that part of the Township of Upton, in the District of 
Three-Rivers [Trois-Rivières], which comprises the eighth, ninth, tenth, eleventh, twelfth, 
thirteenth, fourteenth, fifteenth, sixteenth, seventeenth, eighteenth, nineteenth, twentieth and 
twenty-first ranges of the said Township, is situate from the Town of Three-Rivers, and the want of 
roads and every other means of communication from the said Township to the said Town of 
Three-Rivers, it would be more advantageous for the inhabitants of the said ranges if the said 
ranges were annexed to the County of St. Hyacinth [St. Hyacinthe], in the District of Montreal: Be it 
therefore enacted by the Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty, by and with the advice and consent of 
the Legislative Council and of the Legislative Assembly of the Province of Canada, constituted and 
assembled by virtue of and under the authority of an Act passed in the Parliament of the United 
Kingdom of Great Britain and Ireland, and intituled, An Act to re-unite the Provinces of Upper and 
Lower Canada, and for the Government of Canada, and it is hereby enacted by the authority of the 
same, That from and after the passing of this Act, the whole of the said ranges enumerated in the 
Preamble shall be and are hereby detached from the said Township of Upton and District of 
Three-Rivers, and shall be included in and form part of the Parish of St. Dominique, in the said 
County of St. Hyacinth, and in the District of Montreal, for all Judicial and Municipal purposes. 
 
II. Provided always, and be it enacted, That all suits, actions and proceedings which shall be 
pending at the time of the passing of this Act, in or before any Court, or Tribunal in the said District 
of Three-Rivers, shall, as shall also all matters and proceedings incident or relative thereto or 
dependent thereon, be continued, completed, dealt with and considered as if the said part of the 
Township of Upton had not been detached from the said District. 


