
ANNO TERTIO-DECIMO & QUARTO-DECIMO

VI T O RI Æ R E GIN.E

CAP. LXXXII.

An Act to remove doubts as to the effect of the disallowance of the Act incorporating
the Town of Bytown. [ lOth August, 1850.

HEREAS the Town Council of the Town of Bytown have by their petition

represented that the said Town was incorporated by an ACt. passed in the

Session held in the tenth and eleventh years of Her Majestv's Reign, and intituled, An

Act to define the lirnits of the Town of Bytown, to establish a Tour& Council thercin,

and for other purposes, that the said Act was carried into effect and remained in fuil

-operation until the twelfth day of October, one thousand eight hundred and forty-nine,

wlien Her Majesty's disallowance thereof wvas signified by Proclamation of lis Excel-

lency the Governor General ; that between the passing of the said Act and the signi-
fication of the disallowance thereof, as aforesaid, the Corporation of the Mayor and

Town Couneil of Bvtown, created by the said Act, had, under the provisions thercof,

lawfully entered into divers contracts and incurred divers liabilities, and that at the

date of the said proclamation a large amount of taxes and statute labour was due to

the said Corporation, which said contracts and liabilities have remained and stil renain

uncompleted and unsatisfied, and tie said taxes and statute labour unpaid and unper-
formed by reason of the doubts occasioned by the disalIlowance of the Act aforesaid;

that the schools and school-iatters of the said Town, and- al other matters connecied

with the Municipal affairs of the said Town, are also in much confusion by reason of
the said doubts, which fIlave even extended to the legality of the proceedings of the

Corporation of the said Town, now constituted under the provisions of the Act passed

in the tweifth year of Her Majesty's Reign, and intituled, .An Act to provide by one e c s

general law for the erection of Municipal Corporations and the establishrnent of regru-

lations of Police in, and for he several Counties, Cities, Townfs, Townships ( andTillages

in Up)pe Canada, and the said Town Council of the Town of Bytown h ave prayed
thaL ail sucli doubts as aforesaid may be removed, and that their powers in the matters

aforesaid be confirrned ; And whereas it is clear that the Legisiature, in passing the
Act last above cited, did not contemplate the disallowance of the Act first above cited,
but 0n the contrary provided by the Act passed with reference to that last above cited

in the twelfth year of Her Majesty's Reign, and intituled, An Act to repeal tie Ac in i in SO.

force in Upper Canada relative to the establishnent of local and Miunczpal Authortîes,
and other rnatters of a like nature, it is enacted in effect, that the said first cited Act

shall be repealed upon, from and after the first day of January, one thousand eight
hundred and fifty, and not before, and it is therefore expedient to grant the prayer of

the said Petition and to secure to the Corporation of the said Town and other parties

the sanie relative rights as if the Act first cited had rernained in force until the tine

last aforesaid : Be it therefore deélared and enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent

Majesty, by and with the advice and consent of the Legisiative Council and of the

Legislative Assembly of the Province of Canada, constituted and assembled by virtue of

and under the authority of an Act passed in the Parliament of the United Kingdon of

Great Britain and Ireland, and intituled, An Act to re-unite the Provinces of Upper
and Lower Canada, and for the Government of Canada, and it is hereby declared and

enacted
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enacted by the authority of thesame, That for and notwithstanding hie disallowance of
the Act first cited in the Preamnble to this Act, tlerights, powers, duties; obligations and
liabilities of the Municipa Corporation of the Town of Byto n constituted under the
Act secondly cited in the said Preamble, and of hie Council ofthe said Town and of the
Mayor and every Member thereof; and of ail Obcers thereof and of all other parties
vith respect to thein, shail be and shall be held to 1iave been the saie to all intents

and purposes as they wouid have been if the said firstly cited Act, with the exception
of the forty-fourth section thereof, had been and remained in force fron the passing
thereof until the first day of January, one thousand eight hundred and fiftv, and had
been then repealed by the Act tlirdly cited in the said Preamble: and more especially,
but without prejudice to the full effect of the general provision above rade, Be it
declared and enacted, That the Council of the said Town shall have full power and
authority to colleet, sue for aind recover all arrears of taxes imposed by the late Cor-
)oration for the year one thousand eiglt hundred and forty-nine, and to enforce the
)erfornance of or the pavnent of the commutation for all arrears of statute labour for
the said year, and shall pay all just debts and discharge alljust liabilities of the said late
Corporation, and shail complete and mnay enforce the completion of all coîtracts hur-
fully iade by or with the said late Corporation ; and that aill elections of Councillors,
Mayor or other Oficers or functionaries in or with regard to the said Town, and all
By-laws, Rules or Regulations made, or things (loue by the Council of the said Town,
or by the said Mayor, Counîcillors, Officers or functionaries, or any of them, or by anV

persori under their authority, shall be, andâhall be ield to have been valid and binding,
and shall have, and be leld to have had full force and effect, provided the sane would
have been and would be valid and binding, and have force and effect, if the said firstly
cited Act (with exception of the forty-fourth section) had been and remained in force
froni the passing thereof to the said first day of January, one thousand eight hundred
and fiftyr.
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